
COUNTY COMMISSION RECORD, CAMDEN COUNTY, MISSOURI  

Thursday 09/12/2024 

The Camden County Commission met with Presiding Commissioner Ike Skelton, 
First District Commissioner James Gohagan and Second District Commissioner 
Don Williams.  

Meeting Agenda 

Commissioner Williams made a motion to approve today’s agenda. Commissioner 
Gohagan seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote: Commissioner 
Williams (aye) and Commissioner Gohagan (aye). Session opened at 10:00 A.M.  

Prior Minutes 

Commissioner Williams made a motion to approve the previous meeting minutes. 
Commissioner Gohagan seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote: 
Commissioner Williams (aye) and Commissioner Gohagan (aye).  

New Business 

Sheriff- MOU w/ Climax Springs School District- reporting incidents that occur 
on school grounds-  Schools are legally mandated reporters, and as such, this 
MOU gives the Climax Springs school district the descretion to choose what is 
constituted as third degree assault and should be reported to the Camden County 
Sheriff’s Department. Commissioner Williams made a motion to approve this 
MOU between the Camden County Sheriff’s Department and the Climax Springs 
schools. Commissioner Gohagan seconded the motion. The motion passed by 
vote: Commissioner Williams (aye) and Commissioner Gohagan (aye).   

(see the MOU beginning on the next page) 









Dr. Frank to discuss voting integrity, voting machines, and election integrity- Dr. 
Frank presented to Camden County information he has gathered from all around 
the United States regarding election fraud, election results, and election patterns 
in each state. He focused primarily on Missouri and Camden County for this 
presentation. There were no motions made on this agenda item.   
 
(To listen to the meeting, visit www.camdenmo.org, departments, commission, 
view past meetings, 9-12-24)  
 
Adjourn: With no further official business on the agenda, Commissioner Williams 
made a motion to adjourn to any unofficial business that may develop during the 
day. Commissioner Gohagan seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote: 
Commissioner Williams (aye) and Commissioner Gohagan (aye). Session closed at 
11:41 A.M.   

Ordered that the Commission adjourn until further notice.  

 

_______________________________   ______________________________ 

Ike Skelton, Presiding Commissioner    Jordan Stanton, Admin. Assistant  
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